

NOTE: No claim will be approved for payment unless original copy of this order or the Purchase Order Number is made a part of the claim.

P.O. 31605

Purchase Order LaPorte County LaPorte, Indiana

This number must be shown on invoice, claim and delivery memos.

DATE: 2-20-13

VENDOR NO. 3202

REQ.:

TO: Friedman & Associates, P.C.
705 Lincolnway
LaPorte, IN 46350

In Accordance with Bid or Contract

DEPARTMENT:

SHIP TO:

SHIP VIA DELIVERY

Charge to Appropriation for: Legal Fees
Appropriation Number 1000, 30020, 000, 143

QUANTITY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

Invoice February 18, 2013 \$13,615.00

EXAMINED AND APPROVED BY THE
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE
COUNTY OF LA PORTE, INDIANA.
DATE: [Signature]

APPROVED: [Signature]

LA PORTE COUNTY, INDIANA

FILED

FEB 21 2013

LAPORTE COUNTY AUDITOR

This order issued in compliance with CHAPTER 99, ACTS 1945 and Acts amendatory thereof and supplemental thereto.

TOTAL AMOUNT OF ORDER

\$ 13,615.00

APPROPRIATION BALANCE

\$

I hereby certify that there is an unobligated balance in this appropriation sufficient to pay for the above order.

Auditor

FILED

FEB 20 2013

FEDERAL EXCISE TAX EXEMPT

INDIANA RETAIL TAX EXEMPT
Certificate No. 003118673-001-8

LAPORTE COUNTY AUDITOR

Title

ORDERED BY

Billing on this order must be according to prices shown above.

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE COUNTY OF LA PORTE

Purchasing Agent

Claim

LA# 190958 2/22/13

I, _____ of _____ Indiana hereby certify that the foregoing account is just and correct, that the amount claimed is legally due, after allowing all just credits, and that no part of the same has been paid.

Date _____ 20__

I certify that the within bill is true and correct; that the supplies and materials therein itemized and for which charge is made were ordered by me and were necessary to the public business; that each and every item has been delivered to me at prices mentioned, and was in accordance with contract, except _____

I have examined the within claim and hereby certify as follows:
 That it is in proper form.
 That it is duly authenticated as required by law.
 That it is based upon _____ contract, Statutory authority.
 That it is apparently _____ correct, incorrect.

IN FAVOR OF

Account # _____
 Vendor # _____
 Claim & Docket # _____
 P.O. # _____

Name _____
 Street _____

City _____ State _____ Zip _____

\$ _____
 ON ACCOUNT OF APPROPRIATION
 for _____

Invoice #'s _____

Allowed _____, 20__

In the sum of \$ _____

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE COUNTY OF LA PORTE
 Warrant No. _____ Issued in payment

Shaw-Wentworth

FILED
 FEB 20 2013

FILED
 FEB 20 2013

18-Feb-13

Invoice Submitted To:

LaPorte County Board of Commissioners

For services provided by Friedman & Associates, P.C.

from January 18, 2013 thru February 15, 2013

Litigation/Tort Claims

Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
------	-------------	-------	------	-------

Indiana Farm Bureau Ins.-Cindy Spaeth

2/4/2013 Review Order on Motion to Dismiss filed by Brett Hacker, attorney for Indiana Farm Bureau.

0.15 \$150.00 \$22.50

Roxanne Looper

1/22/2013 Review pleadings; travel to and from Superior Court

No. 2 for hearing on Motion to Compel discovery and review State's produced discovery package.

2.85 \$150.00 \$427.50

Union Benetica Mexicana

1/22/2013 Draft and e-file Entry of Appearance.

0.25 \$150.00 \$37.50

John and Marianne Wantuch

2/7/2013 Review pleadings; analyze case law on official liability

vs personal liability and potential issue of non coverage for certain acts.

1.50 \$150.00 \$225.00

2/11/2013 Phone call with Amanda Hillman at Knight Hoppe

regarding coverage issues; review merit of complaint; review email and draft inquiry to J. Leon regarding personnel code.

0.65 \$150.00 \$97.50

2/12/2013 Review J. Leon email; phone call with Mark

Yagelski regarding potential coverage issues and send personnel handbook.

0.50 \$150.00 \$75.00

2/15/2013 Review update by carrier counsel; draft email to

R. Mrozinski; send to carrier's counsel; review reply; draft followup and review J. Anderson email regarding file handling.

1.25 \$150.00 \$187.50

<u>Foreclosures LaPorte County</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
<u>Libertarian Party</u>	2/6/2013	Review suit and attachments and commence work on Motion to Dismiss.	1.50	\$150.00	\$225.00
	2/8/2013	Prepare Entry of Appearance; additional work on Motion to Dismiss including separation of powers issue and mootness arguments.	1.35	\$150.00	\$202.50
	2/12/2013	Review R, Wolff request for minutes and draft reply.	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00
	2/13/2013	Verify date of service and additional research.	0.75	\$150.00	\$112.50
		Total Billable Hours:	10.95		
		Total Amount for Litigation & Tort Claims:	\$1,642.50		
<u>MLCFC 2007-8 v Cedargate Apartments, et al</u>	2/11/2013	Review of Motion for Stay of Proceedings.	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
<u>Bank of America v Freddy Tillman</u>	1/24/2013	Open file and review of Praecipe to clerk for sale.	0.35	\$150.00	\$52.50
<u>Bank of New York v James Sutherland</u>	2/13/2013	Review of Bankruptcy filing.	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00
<u>Citimortgage v Smith, et al</u>	1/22/2013	Draft Entry of Appearance and file with Court.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50
<u>Fifth Third Bank v Niendorf, et al</u>	2/11/2013	Review Motion to Dismiss filed by Plaintiff.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50
<u>1st Source Bank v 2424 Professional Center, LLP</u>	1/29/2013	Review of Complaint, Draft Entry of Appearance and Answer to Complaint.	1.25	\$150.00	\$187.50
<u>LaPorte Savings Bank v Julius Atwood</u>	2/12/2013	Open file and review of Praecipe for Sheriff sale.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50

1/22/2013	Draft and file Entry of Appearance.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	<u>LaPorte Savings Bank v Crockett, et al</u>
1/22/2013	Draft and file Entry of Appearance.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	<u>LaPorte Savings Bank v Dunlap, et al</u>
1/24/2013	Review of Motion for Summary Judgment and associated materials.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	
2/5/2013	Review of Court Judgment.	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	
1/21/2013	Draft and file Entry of Appearance.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	<u>LaPorte Savings Bank v Mace, et al</u>
1/22/2013	Review Plaintiff's Motion to Dismiss.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	
1/29/2013	Review Judge's Order of Dismissal.	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00	
1/28/2013	Review of Summary Judgment Motion and assorted pleadings.	0.45	\$150.00	\$67.50	<u>LaPorte Savings Bank v NIJ, Inc., et al Rajendra Patel</u>
1/22/2013	Draft and file Entry of Appearance.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	<u>LaPorte Savings Bank v Taylor, et al</u>
1/22/2013	Draft and file Entry of Appearance.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	<u>LaPorte Savings Bank v Warren</u>
1/21/2013	Open and review file.	0.15	\$150.00	\$22.50	<u>PNC Bank v Steven and Dawn Euler</u>
1/24/2013	Draft and file Entry of Appearance.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	
1/24/2013	Review Withdraw of Appearance of Attorney Flynn.	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00	
1/30/2013	Review of instruction to Appraisers and report.	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	<u>State of Indiana v James and Jeanne Reed</u>
2/7/2013	Draft and file Entry of Appearance.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	
2/15/2013	Review Withdraw of Appearance of Attorney Flynn.	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00	
1/22/2013	Draft and file Entry of Appearance.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	<u>Wolford v Sullivan, et al</u>
2/10/2013	Review Motion to Withdraw of Attorney Biege.	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50	
2/15/2013	Review of Notice of Relief from Stay.	0.35	\$150.00	\$52.50	<u>Fifth Third Bank v Brian Watson</u>

LaPorte County Non-Litigation/Litigation Prevention-Avoidance

Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
	Total Billable Hours:	8.35		
	Total for Foreclosure Cases:	\$1,252.50		
LaPorte County Health Department				
1/22/2013	Prepare and attend Health Department meeting.	1.30	\$150.00	\$195.00
2/13/2013	Attend MS4 meeting.	1.60	\$150.00	\$240.00
2/13/2013	Review of Medicare application for EMS.	1.10	\$150.00	\$165.00
	Total Billable Hours:	4.00		
	Total Amount Billed for Health Department:	\$600.00		

1/18/2013 Phone call with Council President Yagelski regarding

Economic Development line item; email M. Schultz regarding PTABOA; review correspondence from constituent regarding Ethics Ordinance repeal; review Auditor inquiry regarding Homestead exemptions; draft reply and review followup; review Dr. Kora followup with planner on various functions; draft email to Elizabeth Flynn regarding Scurlock, Kenafi and O'Brien cases; review reply; review Scurlock memorandum in support of Motion to Strike; draft inquiry to Attorney Flynn regarding Westlake Services, Anthony Tsikouris and Sunterra foreclosure cases; review potential lease space for EMS base; send reply; review inquiry from Lake County Adult Protective Services regarding county home; provide to Commissioners; review Clingerman email regarding construction services on KIP; review Phil Facenda's followup and phone call with Commissioner Decker regarding Economic Development budget.

2.15 \$150.00 \$322.50

1/21/2013 Review jail and water department inquiry; draft

response; review Workone inquiry; draft response; review Reardon email regarding Economic Develop. budget; review LP Hospital and St. Anthony responses to Dr. Kora regarding EMS housings;

review Jack Arnett/CVB correspondence regarding stadium plan; review soil and water department inquiry to MS4 board; draft inquiry to Rick Brown and MS4 acting department head; review 950W updates on Johnson and Pahn road case summary; review Clingerman's track installation update at KIP; phone call with Mike Seitz regarding Severs road; review D. Biege email regarding Plan commission; draft reply; review R. Surber note regarding notice of meetings and review Commissioners' office request for single office department head time sheets

1.50 \$150.00 \$225.00

1/22/2013 Review revised interview questions from Human

Resource director Joyce Leon; review Doug Siege inquiry regarding Administration of sexually oriented business; draft reply; review Simeri invoice; send to Commissioners office; review miscellaneous emails between County Auditor and Janet Eckroate regarding Ray Thorpe settlement; review potential changes to sexually oriented business ordinance; meeting with Commissioner President Millsap regarding Plan commission issues and KIP; review modification to scope of work at KIP project; review MS4 coordinator Rick Brown email; draft reply; draft request to insurance agent of record for summary of carrier handled litigation; review notification regarding removal of electronic recycling from County Highway; review Governmental Insurance agency exchange declination in Daniel Evers and draft email to Phil Faccenda regarding Clingerman submission.

1.65 \$150.00 \$247.50

1/23/2013 Review communication regarding travel with Soil and

Water conservation department; draft reply to Commissioner Millsap; review continuing emails from Faccenda and Clingerman regarding project cost allocation at KIP; review Faccenda followup; brief Commissioners on potential pay dispute; review followup information with R. Surber regarding Soil and Water; review Manhard engineering services agreement regarding project supervisors; review

Commissioner Milsap's direction regarding KIP project funds; phone call with Commissioner Decker regarding cumulative capital development fund; send inquiry to K. Cender; review M. Seitz letter to M. Slater regarding Severs Road; draft reply including Sheriff; phone call with Commissioner Milsap regarding cum cap fund; multiple emails with Attorney Willoughby regarding Thomas King matter and KIP property acquisition; review Highway Engineer Mike Yacullo's assessment of Group II STP funds; draft reply; review Cender reply regarding financial review; draft inquiry to Cender regarding cumulative capital development fund; research approved statutory uses; review County Home farmland proposal and draft opinion on need for public awards.

2.75 \$150.00 \$412.50

1/24/2013 Review breakdown of funding sources supplied for 2011 for LaPorte County Soil and Water district; review R. Surber email regarding executive session; review Mike Yacullo email regarding last over-run regarding writing for community corrections; review attached emails regarding J. Wright communications; phone call with Commissioner Milsap regarding community corrections; review legal notice of Commissioner Milsap and designation of publication required by statute; send transmittal note to R. Surber; draft email to M. Reardon re: KIP construction supervision costs; draft separate email regarding property transfer along Hupp Road; draft email to County Highway Engineer regarding KIP property transfers; review P. Pease inquiry to Commissioner Kora regarding EMS bases; review response; review John Jones notification to Bliss-McKnight; review T. Larson email regarding EMS base and redevelopment commission; review EMS Administrator Pat Pease email; draft reply to T. Larson; review request for reports to department heads; review M. Bishop report on E85 and ADA inventory; emails with M. Rzepka of Gallagher-Bassett; phone call with insurance carrier

representative regarding litigation update; review
Reardon proposed change in Economic Development
budget; review M. Bishop email regarding E85
fueling agreement; multiple emails with M. Polan
regarding MS4 department; review binder of
material supplied by R. Brown; review M. Yacullo
followup on road resurfacing; review M. Bishop
email regarding heat pump at community corrections;
review DLZ follow-up on corrections; review
Reardon's follow-up on Clingerman and KIP project
expense.

4.15 \$150.00 \$622.50

1/25/2013 Review engineer Nick Minich email; review ILPK
exhibits; review memo to Reardon; review draft
memo to Commissioners regarding KIP project
payment disputes; send reply; seek input from each
Commissioner on Economic Development budget;
review M. Reardon followup regarding KIP project
cost allocation; draft memo to Commissioners
regarding use of Civil engineering line item for Dale
Clingerman oversight and fees; phone call with
Council President M. Yagelski regarding GIS, Soil
and Water Department and NICTD; review draft
letter to former Commissioner Layton; send
approval; draft final budget proposal for Economic
Development; send to Yagelski with cover note;
review M. Yacullo followup on possible change
order regarding Community Corrections; send
response; review John Hendricks email regarding
condemnation at 2 County projects; draft reply;
followup with Reardon on additional project at
KIP; review Dr. Kera email regarding hospital EMS
base; review P. Pease response; send Seward
personal inquiry packet to County Insurance agent
of record; review automated data system quote for
LaPorte County Highway Department; review
Attorney Willoughby's email regarding condemnation
cases; draft reply; review B. Glaze email regarding
Community Corrections; review Sheriff email and
draft reply.

3.50 \$150.00 \$525.00

1/28/2013 Review narrative and litigation summaries provided by insurance defense counsel; email J. Jones re: summary; draft revised Economic Development budget after input from Commissioners and co-council president; send to council; meeting with Museum President Arnold Bass and maintenance engineer Jerry Cooley; conference with County Highway Engineer Mike Yacullo regarding Group II STP funding update; review Yacullo followup email; review animal ordinance proceedings; email Attorney Flynn; review response; draft email to Jane Bernard of LaPorte County Animal Shelter; review email from M. Polan regarding MS4 board meeting; draft reply regarding compliance with Open Door Law; review J. Kaminski email regarding conditions of property along Hupp Road; draft reply; send to Commissioners; phone call with Haz-Mat coordinator Jeff Hamilton regarding Fas-Pak; review final approvals on Thorpe settlement; review maintenance bills for County Museum; multiple emails with J. Kaminski, C. Willoughby and co-surveyor Hendricks on remaining steps for property acquisition; review communication from PTABOA Board member Barb Dreiner; send to Assessor Schultz; prepare memo to Commissioners regarding PTABOA; email Reardon regarding KIP survey issues; review reply; review J. Leon memo regarding part time hires; attend Council meeting regarding Economic Development budget and review J. Bernard's reply.

4.25 \$150.00 \$637.50

1/29/2013 Review Dale Clingerman email; draft reply regarding professional fees for rail spur project; miscellaneous emails with Jane Bernard of LaPorte County Animal Shelter regarding Mark Bracken citation; review J. Eckroate followup regarding Thorpe; review D. Biege email regarding administration of sexually oriented business ordinance; send email to Commissioners secretary regarding docketing appointment; review D. Carpenter email regarding Seurlock and Kenia; draft reply indicating conflict

1/31/2013 Review revised memo regarding planner; provide input; continue review of prior commissioner purchases; continue work on proposed travel policy and use of credit cards and multiple emails regarding reimbursement for charges. 0.85 \$150.00 \$127.50

1/30/2013 Review reply of Solid Waste District director regarding recycling container at County Highway; review A. Polan proposed notice; email Commissioner Millsap regarding BZA notice; review revised MS4 workshop notice; review Chief Deputy Sosinski response regarding Mader responses; review other comments on proposed letter regarding Economic Development assignments for planner; meeting with Mayor Milo regarding Economic Development and job training issues; review Robin Surber email regarding proposed travel policy; draft reply; phone call with Commissioner Kora regarding proposed travel policy; review correspondence of NICTD regarding passenger service to Michigan City; review R. Surber email regarding police car bids; draft reply; review material supplied by Soil and Water District; review Dr. Kora email to Matt Rearden regarding Advisory group; review draft zoning ordinance changes and email D. Biege. 2.80 \$150.00 \$420.00

1/30/2013 Review reply of Solid Waste District director regarding recycling container at County Highway; review A. Polan proposed notice; email Commissioner Millsap regarding BZA notice; review revised MS4 workshop notice; review Chief Deputy Sosinski response regarding Mader responses; review other comments on proposed letter regarding Economic Development assignments for planner; meeting with Mayor Milo regarding Economic Development and job training issues; review Robin Surber email regarding proposed travel policy; draft reply; phone call with Commissioner Kora regarding proposed travel policy; review correspondence of NICTD regarding passenger service to Michigan City; review R. Surber email regarding police car bids; draft reply; review material supplied by Soil and Water District; review Dr. Kora email to Matt Rearden regarding Advisory group; review draft zoning ordinance changes and email D. Biege. 3.50 \$150.00 \$525.00

2/1/2013 Review D. Hale email regarding cost overruns on Community Corrections project; draft reply; review inquiry to Economic Development Advisory group; email Commissioner Kora; review revised confidential Secretary position; review petition re: interim appointments; review Scurlock notification; send to Elizabeth Flynn; review R. Szilagyi email regarding prisoner reimbursing counties for cost of incarceration; draft reply; review Elizabeth Flynn's correspondence regarding Construction Management and Design, Inc.; review correspondence in Indiana Farm Bureau v LaPorte County Highway Dept.; review Motion to Dismiss case; review Norfolk Southern correspondence to Commissioner Millsap; draft reply to government relations representative Derek Subletto; review M. Yacullo correspondence to Sanitary counsel Jim Meyer; review ordinance adopting amendment to joint zoning ordinance; review Biege transmittal letter; review James Meyer email; review J. Leon inquiry regarding DOT policy; review Biege follow-up on ordinance; email Commissioners regarding sexually oriented business ordinance; propose Nexus settlement; prepare response to J. Leon; review D. Hale response regarding records retention; phone call with PTABOA Board member Barb Dreiner; review weed ordinance information supplied by J. Roesler; forward to plan commission; review of NICTD position statement on Michigan City track alignment; review 12/20 Sirota statement; review additional background on realignment issue including study; review complaint filed with Auditor regarding Ethics Ordinance and check pertinent statutes and related case law.

4.15 \$150.00 \$622.50

2/4/2013 Review subpoena to LaPorte County Haz-Mat;

draft reply; phone call with Jaye Fuller at IBEW regarding project labor agreements at KLP; phone call with Rick Brown at MS4; phone call with Commissioner Decker regarding Economic Development office and pending Nexus settlement

agreement; phone call with Council President regarding gift policy; review Clerk Spevak inquiry re: election officials training fund; research pertinent statute; phone call with Commissioner Kora re: Economic Development, county finance report and Nexus issues; review Haz-Mat followup regarding subpoena; phone call with Fas-Pak Attorney Phillips; review Phillips email; review County Engineer email to Mr. Reardon regarding 950W; review reply re: traffic counts; phone call with Human Resource officer Joyce Leon regarding inquiry about probation officer and review Polan emails.

2.25 \$150.00 \$337.50

2/5/2013 Phone call with Council President Yagelski regarding cumulative capital development fund; Economic Development issues; phone call with D. Hale; review final stipulation and dismissal of Wendt v McDaniell; send email to E. Stalbrink at Phillips's office; review James Donnelly email and enclosures regarding wood burning stoves; review Commissioner Milsap's memo to Planner; review M. Bishop email regarding CSX zoning overlay districts; review Manatron letter agreement; email approval to D. Hale; review followup on non-party subpoena in Fas-Pak case; review followup on bridges with Norfolk Southern; send to clients; review Haz-Mat coordinator Jeff Hamilton followup regarding Fas-Pak subpoenas; review 2 Sheriff forfeiture petitions; email Mayor John Boyd; review sample document retention policies from Tippecanoe County; draft email to D. Hale; provide litigation update to Gallagher-Bassett in Stano and B. Leslie cases; review Court filing in LaPorte County Libertarian Party v Board of Commissioners; review M. Reardon followup on 950W; review R. Surber email regarding bonding local officials; draft reply; phone call with Dr. Kora regarding Ethics Ordinance; review State Board of Accounts credit card proposed policy; review Biege inquiry regarding litigation update; review Biege response regarding Hupp Road; review Bishop email regarding proposed weed ordinance; review Sheriff's

email regarding meeting; draft reply; review Biege
update regarding Enbridge; review D. Hale email
regarding records policy and review GIE denial
letter to Alan Collins of Construction Management &
Design.

3.10 \$150.00 \$465.00

2/6/2013 Attend Commission meeting; review Milsap followup
on Norfolk Southern; email R. Surber regarding
court; review L. Stalbrink email regarding Wendt
v McDaniel; phone call with Attorney GiaQuinta
regarding Court hearing on Nexus Settlement; review
draft of letter to K. Layton regarding courthouse
exterior; review data of writing update on Community
Correction from D. Hale; review M. Yacullo inquiry
to surveyor Hendricks regarding deed acquisition on
KIP; review Annie Polan's email regarding code
enforcement; draft reply; review Dr. Kora's memo
regarding AED's to Pat Pease; draft letter to
Richard Reel Friends of the Barns; review Joyce
Leon inquiry regarding suspended employees back
pay; draft reply; review P. Pease followup; draft
reply and review Gallagher-Bassett emails regarding
Thorpe.

4.10 \$150.00 \$615.00

2/8/2013 Review D. Carpenter email regarding Brandon
Leslie; draft reply; review inquiry regarding Ronnie
Simmons; review J. Leon reply regarding back pay
issue; review Herceg reply; review Herceg email;
draft reply regarding courthouse restoration; draft
email to D. Reel regarding county barns followup;
draft email to K. Felton; review proposed contract
regarding blanket bond; review draft resolution
request for right of entry form from County Highway
Department; email Elizabeth Flynn regarding Lorte
Nixon and Lavern Gill cases; phone call with Joyce
Leon regarding meal reimbursement/joint county;
review phone inquiry re: county owned property in
Michigan City; review Elizabeth Flynn's response
re; Nixon and Gill; review files in Michelle Steward
vs. LaPorte County, State of Indiana v James Reed;
email M. Kus regarding Laverne Gill; email Jim

Sosinski regarding Lorie Nixon case; review county engineers email regarding Community Corrections sub contract; draft reply; review GIB (Bliss-McKnight) declination of coverage in Libertarian Party; draft email to M. Cartalino at Melrose Pyrotechnics regarding Economic Development; phone call with Chuck Luckman regarding Royal Metals and email to M. Meighen.

2.25 \$150.00 \$337.50

2/9/2013 Review draft letter regarding Tim Man EDC project;

provide comments to M. Reardon; draft correspondence to DLGF Training Division on behalf of PTABOA members; review affidavit for Sheriff Department regarding equitable sharing agreement; review T. Hendricks response regarding county property on Michigan Boulevard; send to Commissioners; review M. Kus email regarding GIB; draft reply; review J. Sosinski email regarding Lorie Nixon; draft reply on need for adverse incident report; review Dr. Kora email regarding PTABOA; draft reply; review Dr. Kora email regarding GIS; multiple emails with DLGF legal counsel regarding PTABOA requirements; review Chief Sosinski followup regarding Michelle Steward and Lorie Nixon incident; review insurance agent of record followup on incident; review county Sewer District Attorney James Meyer and draft agreement regarding 450N and draft sewer use agreement; review notice regarding workshop on Purdue extension; review revised resolution on expenses; email Joyce Leon; review standards for accepting sewer systems; review Dr. Kora email regarding GIS; draft reply; review LaPorte-Starko-Pulaski correspondence and preview project labor agreement employed at Ameriplex development; send correspondence regarding PLA to M. Reardon; email M. Meighen regarding assessment; review Reardon's email regarding SEH contract; draft reply to Mike Yacullo regarding 950W resolution.

3.75 \$150.00 \$562.50

2/10/2013 Review Richard Mrozinski Open Door Complaint;

review Bernacchi and Garner followups; review effect of erroneous notice listing joint session; draft reply; additional review of Fas-Pak discovery date regarding subpoena to HazMat.

1.30 \$150.00 \$195.00

2/11/2013 Emails with Matt Reardon regarding project labor

agreement for Phase II of KIP project; followup with M. Reardon on Economic Development engagement; phone call with Attorney William Kaminski regarding LaPorte Schools executive session memoranda; email R. Surber; phone call with Council President M. Yagelski regarding Economic Development and Health Board; followup emails with Reardon regarding county Economic Development office structure; draft email to Commissioner Milsap regarding Attorney bill of Steve Scheele and phone call with Commissioner Kora regarding Cender study of county finances.

1.20 \$150.00 \$180.00

2/12/2013 Review Commissioner Milsap's request regarding

agenda; review Yacullo followup regarding draft resolution for 950W; phone call with Commissioner Milsap regarding coastal zone management and Scheele fees request; phone call with Commissioner Decker re: "Tin Man" letter; review revised joint Human resource resolution from J. Leon; email Doug Biege re: resolution and Scheele fees; finalize packet for Attorney Phillips in Fas-Pak/LaPorte County and Haz-Mat litigation; review Bert Cook followup on project Tin Man; review M. Reardon email regarding Champion Development; draft reply; review information packet supplied by Attorney Kus regarding Laverne Gill v LaPorte County; review R. Surber email regarding conflict of interest form; draft inquiry to M. Kus on potential representation; review MC credit card policy; draft email to K. Cender regarding travel policy/court financial review; review Attorney Meighen summary of values assigned to NISource properties regarding DLGF website; review new personnel policy for staff in Voter's registration; draft email to Attorney Nick

2/15/2013 Email R. Surber regarding Drayon technology for minutes; review Auditor correspondence regarding schedule fees; review J. Leon emails regarding concurrent resolution; draft reply; review past minutes regarding conflict with Ziolkowski over courthouse exterior; meeting with county's construction representative Ken Herceg for restoration repair regarding re-staining exterior; meeting with County Home Administrator Kay Felton and Richard Reel regarding county barns; meeting following with Felton and Commissioners

1.50 \$150.00 \$225.00 agreement and send email to Tony Hendricks. review Polan followup; review Ortho/Lidar disparaged communities designated by Workone; Attorney Kus on conflict of interest issues; review Administrator Pat Pease; miscellaneous emails with of Medicare application; draft email to EMS Biege email regarding Enbridge; additional review Polan email regarding Holcraft-Enbridge; review of NIPSCO and Blue Chip properties; review M. Jole Winski regarding possible re-trending; revaluing Marilyn Meighen, M. Bernacchi, M. Schultz and Polan memo; draft reply; multiple emails with

2/14/2013 Phone call with Biege regarding Enbridge; review Scheele with opinion letter.

4.15 \$150.00 \$622.50 regarding Layden case and forward claim to Kutz and reply; review email from Attorney Otis regarding regarding NIPSCO and Blue Chip valuations; draft Services center contract; review Meighen emails State Board of Accounts audit review; review Youth regarding assessments, county financial review and litigation; meeting with county Auditor Jole Winski Chief Sosinski and other jail staff regarding pending regarding Johnnie McMillion; meeting with Sheriff, Jeanne Anderson Attorney from Attorney Jeanne Anderson

2/13/2013 Review status report from Attorney Jeanne Anderson and send to client.

2.40 \$150.00 \$360.00 Otis regarding Layden FOIA request; review Cender response regarding County financial review

Milsap regarding Economic Development office; review A. Polan email; review material on Enbridge including correspondence and support documents; send update to Commissioners on County Home and Economic Development staffing; review Yacullo and D. Hale email regarding Community Corrections electrical; draft response; review T. Hendricks email regarding IDAR amendments; draft response; review J. Meyer email regarding 950W sewer extension and draft reply.	3.75	\$150.00	\$562.50
Total Billable Hours:	61		
Total Billable Amount:		\$9,150.00	
Grand Total Billable Amount:			\$12,645.00